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THE YOUTH FAIR ANNOUNCES EXCITING SHOWS 	
  
AT THE ‘WORLD OF AGRICULTURE’	
  

	
  
Including Cowtown, youth cattle show, horse demonstrations, poultry 

bathing & grooming, landscape design & more	
  
	
  
	
  
MIAMI, FL – March 4, 2014 – Now in its 63rd year, The Miami-Dade County Youth Fair & 
Exposition’s World of Agriculture will host a fascinating display of animals, horticulture, and 
new interactive shows.  Fairgoers will enjoy the best of nature inside the World of 
Agriculture Tent every day of The Youth Fair.   	
  
	
  
The World of Agriculture Tent Shows Lineup Includes:	
  
	
  

1. March 13, 11 a.m. – Market Steer Fitting & Grooming	
  
2. March 14, 12:30 p.m. - 4:30 p.m. – Market Swine Show, Showmanship, Fitting & 

Grooming	
  
3. March 15, 11 a.m. - 4 p.m. – Market Lamb Show, Showmanship, Fitting & Grooming	
  
4. March 16, 7 p.m. – 10 p.m. – Santa Gertrudis Show	
  
5. March 17, 7 p.m. – 10 p.m. – Registered Dairy Goat Show, Showmanship, Fitting & 

Grooming 	
  
6. March 18, 7 p.m. – 9 p.m. – Youth Cattle Show	
  
7. March 19, 7 p.m. – Brangus/Red Brangus Show	
  
8. March 21, 7 p.m. – 10 p.m. – Angus Show 	
  
9. March 22, 12:30 p.m. – 7 p.m. – Rabbit Judging and Horse Demonstrations 	
  
10. March 23, 12:30 p.m. – 8 p.m. – Cavy and Rabbit Showmanship	
  
11. March 24, 7 p.m. – Limousin Show	
  
12. March 25, 12:30 p.m. – Poultry Judging & Breed Identification	
  

	
  
 

-more-	
  
	
  
	
  
	
  



13. March 26, 7 p.m. – Brahman Show	
  
14. March 27, 12:30 p.m. – 8:30 p.m. – Poultry Bathing & Grooming	
  
15. March 28, 12:30 p.m. – Poultry Showmanship	
  
16. March 29, 5 p.m. – 10 p.m. – Dairy Show 	
  
17. March 30, 12 p.m. – 6 p.m. – Horse Shows 	
  

	
  
	
  
Fairgoers will also be able to take part in several NEW programs for 2014 in the 
World of Agriculture:	
  

	
  
	
  

● Cowtown - A hands-on, educational experience that will teach kids how to make ice 
cream, cheese, butter, and soap. The exhibit will even have a Texas Longhorn steer.	
  

● Hen House – A display featuring the complete life cycle of poultry.	
  
	
  
“One of the Youth Fair’s key missions is to promote South Florida agriculture and agri-
business” said Bob Hohenstein, President and CEO.  “I am very pleased with the upgrade 
in our World of Agriculture exhibits and programs.  They truly provide our guests an 
opportunity to learn and understand how all the food items purchased at the grocery store 
began their journey on a farm and are produced by men, women and families that literally 
feed the world each and every day.”	
  
	
  
The Youth Fair is located on Coral Way (SW 24th St.) at 112th Ave. Gates open on 
weekdays at 3 p.m., Saturdays and Sundays at 12 noon, and at 12 noon daily during 
Spring Break, which takes place March 21–30, 2014. General admission is $12 and FREE 
admission every day, all day for children 5 years and younger, as well as adults 65 and 
better. Admission for active duty and retired military personnel is $6, Mon.–Thurs. with 
Military ID. Offer valid for active and retired military personnel and up to three guests.  
Guests must present coupon available only at www.fairexpo.com. The Pay One Price 
Unlimited Ride Card is $25 Mondays through Fridays and the Pay One Price Weekend 
Unlimited Ride Card is $35.  Parking is FREE every day, all day! Preferred parking is 
available for $12 per vehicle and is limited.	
  
	
  
The Youth Fair also offers many amenities for families, including: stroller and wheelchair 
rental, lost & found, paved walkways, convenient sitting areas, lush landscape, diaper-
changing facilities in restrooms and more. Sponsors include Coca Cola, KIA, and Sedano’s 
Supermarkets.	
  
	
  
The Miami-Dade County Youth Fair & Exposition, known for generations as The Youth Fair, 
is a state of Florida chartered, private, not-for- profit organization that has donated well 
over $10 million in scholarships, awards and cash premiums to Miami-Dade County 
students and is dedicated to supporting education, showcasing youth achievement and 
promoting South Florida agriculture.  The Youth Fair will take place March 13-30, 
2014.  For more information, please visit www.fairexpo.com or call (305) 223-7060.	
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